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14™ June 2021

REQUEST UNDER THE FREEDOM OF INFORMATION (SCOTLAND) ACT 2002 (FOISA)

Thank you for your request dated 1** June 2021 under the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002
(FOISA).

Your request

You stated/asked the following:

Ferguson's shipyard was nationalised in 2019 and is recruiting more apprentices.

1. How many workers are currently engaged in completing the Glen Sannox and its sister ship currently
known as Hull 802.

2. How many of the workforce are resident and time served from the Inverclyde region and how many
are foreign workers on contract with the Scottish government.
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Response to your request

Please find our response to your request for information:

1. Alldirectly and indirectly employed members of the workforce are currently engaged in completing
the Glen Sannox and its sister ship currently known as Hull 802. As at 1% June 2021, this is 470
workers.

2. Of this number, 360 members of the workforce are directly employed individuals who possess a
contract of employment with Ferguson Marine (Port Glasgow) Limited. Of this 360, 290 are resident
within the Inverclyde area. Please note that we do not hold records as to which employees are time
served within the Inverclyde area.

The remaining 110 workers are indirectly employed and sourced through a third party supplier.
Please note that we do not hold records of where they are resident and time served.

None of our workforce (directly and indirectly employed) are foreign workers on contract with the
Scottish Government.

Your right to request a review

If you are unhappy with this response to your FOI request, you may ask us to carry out an internal review of
the response, by writing to:

FOI Officer

Ferguson Marine (Port Glasgow) Ltd
Newark Works

Castle Road

Port Glasgow

PA14 5NG
foi@fergusonmarine.com

Your review request will be forwarded to the appropriate reviewer. You should explain why you are
dissatisfied with this response, and should be made within 40 working days from the date when you received
this letter. We will complete the review and tell you the result, within 20 working days from the date when

we receive your review request.
If you are not satisfied with the result of the review, you then have the right to appeal to the Scottish

Information Commissioner. More detailed information on your rights is available on the Commissioner’s
website at: www.itspublicknowledge.info.

Yours sincerely,

Victoria Law
FOI Officer





